
Dear high school official/teacher, 
 
 
Computer Science department of the University of Texas at Dallas has touched 1000s of school 
students' lives through Programming Workshops and Summer Camps in the past 2 years. We are 
thrilled to invite your students to our campus to participate in programming contests and Summer 
Camps: 
 
 
State-level Programming Contest on May 30-31  We are excited to team up with TCEA and 
conduct a state-level contest @ UT Dallas. See utd.edu/k12/contest for details and registration. 
We will be covering the hotel and food cost for all out-of-town participants to make it easier for 
you and parents! We are planning for exciting STEM demos and local industry visits as well. 
April 25 is the new deadline to register. 
 
~100 Programming Summer Camps in 11 weeks! Computer Science department of UT Dallas is 
thrilled to offer nearly 100 hands-on Programming Summer Camps to school students (3rd 
graders and up). We introduce programming to our young guests in enjoyable manner using 
Animation, Drawings, Music and Robots. Animation using Scratch, Enjoyable Programming 
using Alice, Enjoyable Programming using JavaScript & Intro to programming in Java are a few 
popular Summer Camps. See utd.edu/k12/summer for the full list and registration details. Our 
rates are very reasonable - just $200 for one full-week camp (includes 5 lunches, snacks, T-shirt 
and certificate). Additional discounts available for low income students and school teachers. 
Techy Girls Residential Camp Any girl 16 to 18 years old (Girls entering 11th or 12th grade in 
Fall 2014) is eligible to apply; No programming experience necessary. Camp will run from 
Monday July 14th at 9 am - Thursday July 17th at 1pm. Following topics will be covered: 
Animation in Alice using Drag-and-drop programming, Fancy Drawings using JavaScript, 
Controlling Robots using Python & Mobile Application Development. Students need to submit 
the application and additional documents mentioned in 
utd.edu/~veerasam/flyers/techygirlscamp.pdf first. You will get the instructions to pay the 
registration fee upon approval. 
 
Residential Option for students from other cities You do not need to be a Dallas area resident to 
attend UT Dallas Summer Camps! We are opening our doors (literally) to students who live in 
other cities/states/countries! See utd.edu/k12/residential for details. We have worked hard to 
arrive at reasonable pricing. Note that multi-week stay includes weekends. 
 
Off-site camps at your location! If you do not want to come to us, we can come to you :-) If you 
prefer us to come to your place to conduct Summer Camps so that lot of your students can 
benefit, we will be happy to do so - Review utd.edu/~veerasam/flyers/utdcsor_offsite.pdf and 
email us to get started. 
 
Robotics Camps The Science and Engineering Education Center (SEEC) at the University of 
Texas at Dallas is a leader in STEM education and PBL teaching initiatives in Texas. This year 
we are offering students a variety of summer camps to provide exciting enrichment opportunities 
in STEM. We are offering middle school camps in Robotics both LEGO Robotics (used in 



FIRST LEGO League) and Tetrix Robotics (used in FIRST Tech Challenge). We are also 
offering high school camps in building a solar car, introduction to space with rockets and 
weather balloons, and quad copters. More information is at our website at 
utd.edu/seec/SummerCamps2014.html. These camps provide a wonderful opportunity to learn 
more about science, technology, engineering and mathematics. We look forward to see you this 
summer! 
 
You can access the flyers @ http://utd.edu/~jeyv/events.pdf, print and display in the bulletin 
boards.  Thanks for your time and have a great Summer! 
 
-- 
 
Dr. Jey Veerasamy, Erik Jonsson School, UT Dallas 
 
Director, Center for Computer Science Education & Outreach 
 
Teaching Faculty, Computer Science 
 
972-883-4241  

 jeyv@utdallas.edu 
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